

**BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION**

**U-CHANNEL SIGN POSTS & BRACKETS  
RECORD OF BIDS**

DATE: 17-Mar-16

<b>CONTRACTOR</b>		<b>MD Solutions</b>		<b>Rathco</b>		<b>Comade</b>		<b>Dornbos</b>					
<b>QTY</b>	<b>ITEMS</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Amount</b>	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Amount</b>
200	922 x Cap	2.75	550.00	2.95	590.00	No Bid		3.83	766.00				
250	990X Cross/Ext.	2.75	687.50	2.95	737.50	No Bid		3.83	957.50				
200	91UXNU180	2.75	550.00	2.95	590.00	No Bid		3.83	766.00				
300	91UXOL90	2.75	825.00	2.95	885.00	No Bid		3.83	1,149.00				
100	457X (Adj. Baskets)	2.75	275.00	3.35	335.00	No Bid		7.70	770.00				
200	#8 Wing Cantilever	4.00	800.00	5.00	1,000.00	No Bid		5.90	1,180.00				
<b>SIGN POSTS</b>													
750	7' 1.33#/ft. U-Channel (Deli. Post)	5.02	3,765.00	5.85	4,387.50	7.41	5,557.50	5.56	4,170.00				
250	11'-3#/ft. U-Channel	17.30	4,325.00	17.05	4,262.50	20.44	5,110.00	19.11	4,777.50				
750	12'-3#/ft. U-Channel	18.80	14,100.00	18.60	13,950.00	22.18	16,635.00	20.85	15,637.50				
750	14'-3#/ft. U-Channel	22.04	16,530.00	21.70	16,275.00	27.07	20,302.50	24.33	18,247.50				
100	16'-3#/Ft.	24.95	2,495.00	24.80	2,480.00	30.76	3,076.00	27.80	2,780.00				
<b>TOTAL AMOUNT BID:</b>		<b>\$44,902.50</b>		<b>\$45,492.50</b>		<b>\$50,681.00</b>		<b>\$51,201.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>	

**Terms:**

**Remarks:**