

**BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION**

1 of 1

ICE CONTROL SAND

RECORD OF BIDS

DATE: 24-Mar-16

BIDDER:	<i>Michiana Aggr.</i>		<i>Red Arrow</i>		<i>Kalin</i>							
	PRICE PER TON		PRICE PER TON		PRICE PER TON		PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON
ESTIMATED QUANTITIES	PRIMARY	SECONDARY	PRIMARY	SECONDARY	PRIMARY	SECONDARY	PRIMARY	SECONDARY	PRIMARY	SECONDARY	PRIMARY	SECONDARY
Benton Harbor 1000 Ton	5.25	No Bid	5.57	5.57	5.82	No Bid						
Bakertown 1000 Ton	4.36	No Bid	4.25	4.25	4.34	No Bid						
Eau Claire 500 Ton	4.89	No Bid	4.85	4.85	5.82	No Bid						
Baroda 1500 Ton	5.09	No Bid	4.58	4.58	5.32	No Bid						
Watervliet 500 Ton	6.09	No Bid	6.25	6.25	7.41	No Bid						
STOCKPILE LOCATION	Hendershoot Pit											
PRICE PER TON	\$2.60											
STOCKPILE LOCATION	MAI US-12											
PRICE PER TON	\$2.60											
STOCKPILE LOCATION												
PRICE PER TON												