

# BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

ASPHALT EMULSIONS

## RECORD OF BIDS

16-Apr-15

<b>BIDDER</b>	<b>Bit Mat</b>	<b>Asphalt Matl's</b>	<b>Michigan Paving</b>			
<b>DESTINATION</b>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>
<b>MS-OP</b>						
Tank Truck Transport (Approx. 15,000 Gal,)	\$ 2.38	No Bid	No Bid			
Berrien County Road Commission to Pickup	\$ 2.30	No Bid	No Bid			
	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>
Based on Posted Price of asphalt cement of:	\$ 450.00	N/A	N/A			
Invoiced price decrease will be:	\$ 0.015					
<b>POLYMER MODIFIED</b>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>
Tank Truck Transport (Approx. 600,000 Gal)	\$ 1.75	\$ 1.82	\$ 2.5439			
Berrien County Road Commission to Pickup	\$ 1.70	\$ 1.82	\$ 2.3700			
	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>
Based on Posted Price of asphalt cement of:	\$ 450.00	455.00	410.00			
Invoiced price decrease will be:	\$ 0.015	0.014	0.0025			
<b>LOCATION OF PLANT:</b>	<i>South Bend, IN</i>	<i>Monroe, MI</i>	<i>Alma, MI</i>			