

BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

ASPHALT EMULSIONS

BASE PROPOSAL - RECORD OF BIDS

23-Mar-17

BIDDER	BIT MAT	Michigan Paving	Asphalt Materials			
DESTINATION	PRICE PER GAL	PRICE PER GAL	PRICE PER GAL	PRICE PER GAL	PRICE PER GAL	PRICE PER GAL
A. MS-OP						
Tank Truck Transport (Approx. 60,000 Gal.)	\$ 2.15	No Bid	No Bid			
Berrien County Road Commission to Pickup	\$ 2.07	No Bid	No Bid			
	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON
Based on Posted Price of asphalt cement of:	\$ 375.00	No Bid	No Bid			
Invoiced price decrease will be:	\$ 0.15	n/a	n/a			
B. ALTERNATE BID: DUSTSTOP	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER GAL	PRICE PER GAL	PRICE PER GAL	PRICE PER GAL
Tank Truck Transport (Approx. 60,000 Gal)	\$ 1.178	No Bid	No Bid			
Berrien County Road Commission to Pickup	\$ 1.098	No Bid	No Bid			
C. HFS-2M	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON	PRICE PER TON
Tank Truck Transport (Approx. 700,000 Gal)	\$ 1.438	1.52	2.0568			
Berrien County Road Commission to Pickup	\$ 1.358	1.45	2.00			
Based on Posted Price of asphalt cement of:	\$ 375.00	325.00	306.67			
Invoiced price decrease will be:	\$ 0.15	0.02	0.015			
LOCATION OF PLANT:	South Bend, IN	Monroe, MI	Oregon, OH			

BERRIEN COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

ASPHALT EMULSIONS

OPTIONAL PROPOSAL - RECORD OF BIDS

23-Mar-17

BIDDER	BIT MAT	Michigan Paving	Asphalt Materials			
<i>DESTINATION</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>
A. MS-OP - ASPHALT EMULSION (ANIONIC)						
<i>Tank Truck Transport (Approx. 60,000 Gal.)</i>	\$ 2.25	No Bid	No Bid			
<i>Berrien County Road Commission to Pickup</i>	\$ 2.17	No Bid	No Bid			
<i>Based on Posted Price of asphalt cement of:</i>	\$ 425.00	No Bid	No Bid			
<i>Invoiced price decrease will be:</i>	\$ 0.015	n/a	n/a			
B. ALTERNATE BID: DUSTSTOP	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>	<i>PRICE PER GAL</i>
<i>Tank Truck Transport (Approx. 60,000 Gal)</i>	\$ 1.278	No Bid	No Bid			
<i>Berrien County Road Commission to Pickup</i>	\$ 1.198	No Bid	No Bid			
C. HFS-2M	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>	<i>PRICE PER TON</i>
<i>Tank Truck Transport (Approx. 700,000 Gal)</i>	\$ 1.538	1.62	2.07			
<i>Berrien County Road Commission to Pickup</i>	\$ 1.458	1.55	2.00			
<i>Based on Posted Price of asphalt cement of:</i>	\$ 425.00	350.00	320.0000			
<i>Invoiced price decrease will be:</i>	\$ 0.015	0.02	0.015			
LOCATION OF PLANT:	South Bend, IN	Monroe, MI	Oregon, OH			