
01/05/2017

Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount Unit Price Amount

WATERVLIET
2,000             Ind. No. 11 BF Slag 15.99         31,980.00      No Bid No Bid

500                Ind. No 9BF Slag 15.45         7,725.00        No Bid No Bid

2,500             Michigan 26A Limestone No Bid No Bid 31.85       79,625.00           

2,500             Michigan 34CS No Bid No Bid 32.85       82,125.00           

2,500             Michian 25A Native No Bid No Bid No Bid

BENTON HARBOR
3,500             Ind. No. 11 BF Slag 15.14         52,990.00      No Bid No Bid

500                Ind. No. 9 BF Slag 14.64         7,320.00        16.20       8,100.00             No Bid

400                Ind. No. 5 BF Slag 14.64         5,856.00        15.00       6,000.00             No Bid

4,000             Michigan 26A Limestone No Bid No Bid 32.85       131,400.00         

4,000             Michigan 34CS No Bid No Bid 33.85       135,400.00         

4,000             Michigann 25A Native No Bid No Bid No Bid

100                Septic Slag 15.45         1,545.00        14.50       1,450.00             No Bid

EAU CLAIRE
2,000             Ind. No. 11 BF Slag 15.14         30,280.00      No Bid No Bid

750                Ind. No. 9 BF Slag 14.99         11,242.50      No Bid No Bid

400                Ind. No. 5 BF Slag 14.69         5,876.00        No Bid No Bid

2,500             Michigan 26A Limestone No Bid No Bid 32.85       82,125.00           

2,500             Michigan 34CS No Bid No Bid 33.85       84,625.00           

2,500             Michigann 25A Native No Bid No Bid No Bid

100                Septic Slag 15.45         1,545.00        No Bid No Bid
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THREE OAKS
2,000             Ind. No. 11 BF Slag 13.99       27,980.00      No Bid No Bid

500                Ind. No. 9 BF Slag 13.79       6,895.00        No Bid No Bid

500                Ind. No. 5 BF Slag 13.69       6,845.00        No Bid No Bid

2,500             Michigan 26A Limestone No Bid No Bid 34.35             85,875.00           

2,500             Michigan 34CS No Bid No Bid 35.85             89,625.00           

2,500             Michigann 25A Native No Bid No Bid No Bid

100                Septic Slag 14.44       1,444.00        No Bid No Bid

BAKERTOWN
4,000             Ind. No. 11 BF Slag 14.39       57,560.00      No Bid No Bid

500                Ind. No. 9 BF Slag 13.89       6,945.00        No Bid No Bid

500                Ind. No. 5 BF Slag 13.69       6,845.00        No Bid No Bid

4,500             Michigan 26A Limestone No Bid No Bid 34.10             153,450.00         

4,500             Michigan 34CS No Bid No Bid 35.85             161,325.00         

4,500             Michigann 25A Native No Bid No Bid No Bid

200                Septic Slag 14.44       2,888.00        No Bid No Bid

BARODA
4,000             Ind. No. 11 BF Slag 14.69       58,760.00      No Bid No Bid

500                Ind. No. 9 BF Slag 14.04       7,020.00        No Bid No Bid

400                Ind. No. 5 BF Slag 13.94       5,575.00        No Bid No Bid

4,500             Michigan 26A Limestone No Bid No Bid 33.85             152,325.00         

4,500             Michigan 34CS No Bid No Bid 34.10             153,450.00         

4,500             Michigann 25A Native No Bid No Bid No Bid

100                Septic Slag 14.99       1,499.00        No Bid No Bid
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